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CITY OF NEW BEDFORD DATE_+2-203
AND/OR STORM DRAIN PERMIT .
ez Expire date: I.wl_wf.g@r

This certifies that perniission is granted to

............................ EPQJ@B@T@QMOO_FLO
Address [-cirhoven M 1 OG23q Tel.

, to the sewer and/or storm drain jn, OOJJJﬁ_J«J@U_\iID
SYSEL

To be laid in accordance with the conditions jn this application and the City of New Bedford ordinances,

TYPE OF USE: RESIDENTIAL COMMERCIAL INDUSTRIAL FLOW G.P.D.

If applicant other than .nnE& Property owner, attach Letter of Authorization from Property Owner.
Moo ns & G e Tl
Mailing >m&nmm.dv.:— P.. ..................................................................................................................
The Bonded Contractor/Drain Layer authorized to perform this work is |
Z.Ng IZ 0! w-z—-l*j- 1.-“- -y >a&-—.|nwm --------------------------------------------------- .-H““W -----------------
Type of Pipe Required:........... ..~ et

PERMIT EXPIRES ONE YEAR AFTER DATE OF ISSUE

.wna__wnmmaunaﬁ connections for Sewage and storm drain where applicable. Storm water cannot be discharged to a
- sanitary sewer. :
® All work must be inspected and approved by a D.P.I. inspector before backfilling,
* Ifthis connection js to be part of a private service shared Jointly with other building owners, attach copy of Recorded
Joint Maintenance Agreement.
®  Permits can be issued to Industrial and/or Commercial Applicants only upon receipt and approval by the Commissioner of

Public Infrastructure of required pl
® Inaddition, a City-issued Industrial User Dj i a Sewer Extension/Connection Permit issued by the
- Commonwealth of Massachusetts D.E P.s City for Industrial Discharge into the sewer System
Industrial User Discharge Permit No..edests 1 Bermmsamsgigis e
Comm. Mass, Sewer Conn./Ext. PermitNo. X1 = (3 Y. s Date.. .ﬁ.ou..u.,,.l.b,.anmuv .................................
A Filing and Inspection Fee of $.839.,, plus an Entrance Fee of $.3%63 S Where applicable, must accompany this application,

; ; L-E
WMDY oot awr_c.mrar T . SHI9297

Bank#, Check# ST @ 3 Y Date_ 34X -702 | Receip IS 2 J
e
Sewer ]//
Connection made to Part of jointly-shared private line YES KZO\\
Storm Drain

Applicant »_n..mmm to abide by the above terms, as well as a|) Pertinent ordinances of the City of New Bedford, and such
other mw,aan_ rules as the Commissioner of Public Infrastructure and/or City Engineer deem necessary

a\)
—Asst-Cit Engineer Signature of Prop

s Y7 ﬁ%ﬁ\\
_ INSPECTOR’S REPORT

INSPECTED By:

-

DATE:

COMMENTS:
e e e e

/c
APPROVED ISAPPROVED SKETCH PLAN

SIGNATURE

A-ocntn|.l-.c.a-cun-oo-opOuyu.cuo

ty Owner or Representative
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No._ 1V ~OM FEE $60.0d
COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

Board of Health, _ NEY! BEDFORD , MA

DISPOSAL SYSTEM CONSTRUCTION PERMIT

Permission is hereby granted to; Construct( ) Repair( ) Upgrade( ) Abandon(X) anindividual sewage disposal system
at_ 0D Witk ST. Vew Redoed ™Mo as described in the application for
Disposal System Construction Permit No. &]*(!2'_‘[ ,dated _8-37-Q\

Provided: Construction shall be completed within three years of the date of thispermi

Form 1255 Rev. 5/96 A.M. Sulkin Co. Boston, MA Date _é‘ééﬁﬁil_ Board of Health

conditions must be met.




Cheveli A. Torres

From: Cheveli A. Torres

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 2:48 PM
To: Sarah Porter

Subject: Abandonment of Septic

Good Afternoon, Sarah
202 Wilbur St, would like to disconnect from the septic system and connect to city sewer. Please let me know if this is
good.

Thank you

Cheveli Torres

Office Assistant IlI

City of New Bedford | Public Infrastructure

1105 Shawmut Ave, New Bedford, MA 02746

® bedford 508.979.1550 x 67305 email:ctorres@newbedford-
ma.gov

lighting the way




. A0l
From: . Bruce C. Hebbe] wwr.\

Sent: Friday, February 26, 2021 11:41 AM
To: Michele Pay|

Cc: Erin M, lacoponi

Subject: RE: 202 Wilbur st

Hi Michele,

_Property:.

Bruce C, Hebbel, p.G.

Dept. of Environmenta| Stewardship
508-984-2659 Office

508-400-2967 Mobile

From: Michele Paul A__Smn_:m_m.vm:__®:ms.&m9no&-3m.mo<v
Sent: Friday, February 26,2021 11:33 AM

To: Bruce . Hebbel Am.:._nm.ImgQ@:mécmo{o&-ﬁzm.mo,\v
Cc: Erin M. lacoponi Am_mnouos_.@u:méwmaﬁoa-:‘_m.mo,\v
Subject: Fw: 202 Wilbur St

It does not dppear that that this Property has any issyes with wetlands. Bruce, this was off the parcel info. It’s south of
195 opposite Sullivan’s Ledge. Do Yyou agree?
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) Michele Paul, LSP
: me Director of Resilience and Environmental Stewardship

& bedford

lighting the way
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Explore the NB Resilient Dashboard!

From: Erin M. lacoponi <Elacoponi@newbedford-ma.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 26, 2021 10:34 AM
To: Michele Paul <Michele.Paul@newbedford-ma.gov>

Subject: 202 Wilbur St

Good Morning Michele,

I had the Owner of 202 Wilbur St. call Regarding abandoning the current Septic System and connecting to City Sewer.
Could You please advise if there are any Wetlands at this location?

Thanks,
7z W, e
] ', e i u
z BN el Erin Iacoponi
W 1 3 2 : mu
< “ o Financial Assistant |
[y City of New Bedford | DPI
C
= M\Nme 1105 Shawmut Ave, New Bedford, MA 02746
B hedford 508.979.1550 | email erin.iacoponi




G PAYMENT RECPT#: 3419242 MISCELIANEQUS PAYMENT RECPT#: 3419233

Aford City of New Bedford
Bedf | 133 William St.
"02740 " New Bedford MA 02740
: 11:47 DATE: 07/13/21 TIME: 11:45
CLERK: a450mnb DEPT:

CUSTOMER#: O

COMMENT: STUB FEE

T SEWER PERMI ﬁo% CHG: DPISEW DPI SEWER PERMI 367.50
REVENUE:
450.00 1 63906000 422185 367.50
Sewer Permit Fee
CASH:
450.60 THO5 101009 367.50

Cash Treasurer Dep W

. AMOUNT PAID: 367.50
PAID BY: LINDA RYAN
PAYMENT METH: CHECK

MR1142
REFERENCE:
' AMT TENDERED: 367.50
AMT APPLIED: 367.50

[CHANGE:: .00
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