APPLICATION FOR

CITY OF NEW BEDFORD O e
MASSACHUSETTS PAVED
ENGINEERING- 508-979-1550 SIDEWALK/ DRIVEWAY

Expires:_ :u_\w@_‘ bD\w_\

Application No. \GEA _ (Umﬁo” 3| ,Q \ e \ L(Q
. St
#Property Ovmer: _ rmwmﬂﬁ WoiTyn A Tet: SO¥-207-33296
Adress: JO% Sk, $+ New Bedd m_wL I A OFF40
Street - City State . zip code
The above hereby request permission to construct a paved: V2" driveway / sidewalk
located at fOF Seni Hn S ,plot (&  ,lot_35© inaccordance
swith the terms and conditions set forth herein, and the Ordinances of the City of New Bedford.
Sidewalk Dimensions Driveway Width (ft)
___ Residential _ Residential :
___ Commercial ___ Commercial
___ Bituminous Concrete ____Relocation / Widening
___ Concrete Full Width _ __«Curb Removal [2' Curb ot
___ Concrete w/ Grass Ribbon l\\OoboHoﬁo
Curb needed ____ Bituminous Concrete

OoQWuoEm“ .MDA&M“P,\ cpon as _ pack of Colecs S Koeiod Nmno.c?co&ws

Du‘.,mnT : WB\W.&L s g ' Coment (oncre -
] A WJ..D.) -
Bonded Contractor: DP. ~\F>LA s Tel: 6UF - 545~ %Y |
Traffic Commission: Approved Rejected Date
Signature
Building Dept. Approved (New Building)
“y_ Approved — Bldg. Permit # 20-2198
___ Rejected
" Qovna, Ao nOto W e

v Signature() ™

Engineering Dept. Approved Rejected _iC);

" Dhawics Mj N

™

Signature d

Permit / Inspection fee of $150.00 must accompany this application.

Special Requirements: Contractor to call 24 hrs. in advance for pre-inspection (prior to
pouring). If curbing is removed, it must be returned in whole
pieces within 24 hrs. to the D.P.I. City Yard on Liberty St. (btwn
Parker St. & Durfee St.) accompanied with original curbing

receipt.
Nee .
PAID: /AD =  Check# 2077~
: : » ‘ : t "
Sopbanic [lamgevlen s Seall Woitunid
Supervising Civil. Engineer v : tive)

W%“Oejﬁblotru,\m; oo

1105 mwmﬁ,ﬁﬁ Avenue, New Bedford, MA 02746 Telephone 508-979-1550 Fax 1-508-961-3054



MISCELLLANEDUS PAYMENT RECPT#: 3107791
City of New Bedford

133 William St.

New Bedford M4 02740

DATE: 12/10/2 TIME: 11:11
CLERK: a450mmb DEPT:
CUSTOMERE: ©
OMMENT :
CHG: DPIDRY DPI DRIVEWAY PE 150.00
REVENUE: )
I 03406000 454010 150.00
DPI - Driveway-Sidewalk Permit
CASH:
TWOS 101009 150.00

Cash Treasurer Dep W

AMOUNT PAID: 150.00
PAID BY: SCOTT WOJTUNIK
PAYMENT METH: CHECK
MR2072
REFERENCE
AMT TENDERED: 150.00 .
AMT APPLIED: 150.00

CHANGE : .00
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Amanda Jupin

= =rie S e
From: Dennis Souza Jr.
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 10:34 AM
To: Amanda Jupin
Subject: FW: Driveways--- Cottage Street project

From: Stephanie Crampton <Stephanie.Crampton@newbedford-ma.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 8:14 AM

To: Danny Romanowicz <DRomanowicz@newbedford-ma.gov>; Dennis Souza Jr. <Dennis.Souza@newbedford-ma.gov>
Cc: Carl Bizarro <Carl.Bizarro@newbedford-ma.gov>; Dean Kalavritinos <Dean.Kalavritinos@newbedford-ma.gov>;
Manuel Silva <MSILVA@newbedford-ma.gov>

Subject: RE: Driveways--- Cottage Street project

Great. Thank you Danny and your team for coordinating and resolving these three driveways with a quick turnaround.
We will have PA Landers set the curb openings for all three driveways.

Have a good day,

Stephanie Crampton, EIT

Assistant City Engineer

City of New Bedford | Department of Public Infrastructure
1105 Shawmut Ave, New Bedford, MA 02746
508.979.1550 ext. 67333

email: stephanie.crampton@newbedford-ma.gov

lighting the way

From: Danny Romanowicz <DRomanowicz@newbedford-ma.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 8:00 AM

To: Stephanie Crampton <Stephanie.Crampton@newbedford-ma.gov>; Dennis Souza Jr. <Dennis.Souza@newbedford-
ma.gov>

Cc: Carl Bizarro <Carl.Bizarro@newbedford-ma.gov>; Dean Kalavritinos <Dean.Kalavritinos@newbedford-ma.gov>;
Manuel Silva <MSILVA@newbedford-ma.gov>

Subject: Driveways--- Cottage Street project

Stephanie/Dennis

We have contacted all parties and you can move forward with 109 Smith Street, 392 Cottage Street ,and 473
Cottage Street .

Thank you and,
Enjoy the day

Danny



W Danny D. Romanowicz CBO
@ Director of Inspectional Services and
l,m_ua Commissioner of Buildings

. = m% City of New Bedford | Inspectional Services
133 William Street, Room 308, New Bedford, MA 02740

£ bedford 508.979.1540 | email:danny.romanowicz@newbedford-ma.gov

light




